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1. Abstract
Carcinosarcoma or metaplastic carcinoma of the breast with mes-
enchymal differentiation classified as subtypes of metaplastic 
breast carcinoma (MBC) is a rare and highly aggressive tumor. 
Metastasis to soft tissue and bone is a challenging issue to make a 
diagnosis because of similarity to the mesenchymal tumor.

This clinical data reported female patient presenting with rapidly 
growing chest wall mass and immunohistochemistry revealed met-
astatic carcinosarcoma which distinguish from other mesenchymal 
tumors.

2. Introduction
Carcinosarcoma of the breast is a rare and highly aggressive tumor 
that occurs for 0.25-1% of all breast cancers diagnosed annually 
[1]. Mean age of diagnosis is fifth to sixth decade of life. His-
topathologically, carcinosarcoma is a poorly differentiated cancer 
that is composed of a mixture of carcinoma cells and nonepithelial 
mesenchymal components that included elements of chondroid, 
osteoid, rhabdomyoid and neuroglial differentiation[2]. According 
to W.H.O. classification of tumors of the breast published in 2012, 
Carcinosarcoma is one of the five distinct subtypes of metaplastic 
breast cancer which other subtypes include squamous cell carcino-
ma, low-grade adenosquamous carcinoma, spindle cell carcinoma, 
and fibromatosis-like metaplastic carcinoma [3]. 

This cancer is usually triple-negative [4] but hormone receptor sta-
tus does not appear to affect prognosis [5], the prognosis is worse 
due to present with a more advanced stage at diagnosis. Lung and 
pleural metastases are the most common site [6]. The systemic 
therapy also appears to be less effective [7].

3. Case Report
A 49-year-old female was previously diagnosed with stage II (pT-
2N0M0) grade III invasive ductal carcinoma of the left breast with 
triple-negative phenotype in 2012. She underwent left modified 
radical mastectomy and was treated with FAC (Fluorouracil/Doxo-
rubicin/cyclophosphamide) regimen as an adjuvant chemotherapy. 
After two years, she found 1 cm right breast mass by annual breast 
examination, and core needle biopsy showed invasive ductal car-
cinoma grade III. Accordingly, modified radical mastectomy was 
also done on right breast. In November 2019, she noticed a soft 
mass on the middle of her chest wall which gradually increased 
in size. She denied any symptom of chest discomfort or tender-
ness. MRI showed 10.0x4.8x5.6 cm soft tissue enhancing mass 
with hypointense SI on T1W and hyperintense SI on T2W at ante-
rior upper chest wall which destroyed manubrium and body of the 
sternum. Mass invaded to anterior and superior mediastinum space 
and encased SVC. She denied treatment and sought for alternative 
medicine (Figure 1-8).	
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Figure 1: H&E of chest wall mass, epithelioid cell neoplasm cells are arranged in cord and trabecular patterns with myoid stroma

Figure 2: H&E of chest wall mass, epithelioid cell neoplasm cells are arranged in cord and trabecular patterns with myoid stroma

Figure 3: IHC of chest wall mass, positive for AE1/AE3
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Figure 4: IHC of chest wall mass, positive for S100

Figure 5: IHC of chest wall mass, positive for GATA3

Figure 6: H&E of right breast tissue, invasive ductal carcinona
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Figure 7: H&E of right breast tissue, epithelioid cell neoplasm cells are arranged in cord and trabecular patterns with myoid stroma

Figure 8: chest wall mass
In March 2020, two months prior to admission, she came back to 
our hospital and first biopsy of chest wall mass was performed. 
Tissue histopathology reported epitheloid cell neoplasm infiltrat-
ing the intertrabecular spaces, tumor cells are arranged in cord 
and trabecular patterns with myoid stroma. The immunohisto-
chemistry showed diffusely positive S100, Vimentin, and colla-
gen type IV (stain around nests of cells), focally positive for AE1/
AE3, CAM5.2, and negative for Arginase-1, Glypican3, HepPar-1, 
TTF1, p40. The differential diagnosis was parachordoma, mesen-
chymal chondrosarcoma, and metastatic carcinosarcoma.

Two weeks prior to admission, she her dyspneic symptom became 
worse and persisted even at rest. She could not lie down and her 
face gradually swollen. She visited King Chulalongkorn Memorial 
hospital and was admitted.

At admission, chest computerized tomography scan revealed a 
10.1x13.4x16.1-cm lobulated heterogeneous enhancing anterior 
mediastinal mass with associated bony destruction of manubrium, 
sternum, tumor thrombi of all segmental branches of pulmonary 

arteries, SVC. Innumerable various-sized of pulmonary nodules 
scattered in both lungs. SVC syndrome with tumor thrombi of 
pulmonary arteries with pulmonary metastases was diagnosed. 
Second biopsy of chest wall mass showed malignant epithelioid 
neoplasm with chordoma like pattern. The immunohistochemistry 
showed 50-60% positive for S100, 5- 10% positive for AE1/AE3 
in general area and focal densely in solid area and positive for 
GATA3 focal densely in solid area which represented chest wall 
tissue was originated from breast tissue. The review of previous 
right breast tissue revealed epithelioid cell neoplasm cells are ar-
ranged in cord and trabecular patterns with myoid stroma is also 
present focally. Finally, metastatic carcinosarcoma was concluded 
as diagnosis after immunohistopathology and clinical data was in-
corporated.

Plan of treatment was carefully discussed with patient and her rel-
atives. Eventually, she did not receive any systemic therapy due to 
limited performance status and received palliative radiotherapy at 
chest wall mass for pain relieving.
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4. Discussions
Our reported case was finally diagnosed recurrent carcinosarcoma 
of the breast with chest wall and pulmonary metastases. Tissue 
histopathology reported epithelioid cell neoplasm which arranged 
in cord and trabecular patterns with myoid stroma. The immuno-
histochemistry was done to distinguish the types of tumor includ-
ed parachordoma, mesenchymal chondrosarcoma and metastatic 
carcinosarcoma. Positive for S100, EMA, Collagen type 4, and 
vimentin supported parachordoma and carcinosarcoma which is 
almost always found these IHC stains while 50% of mesenchymal 
chondrosarcoma were positive for S-100 protein and EMA [8].

However, GATA3 focal densely in solid area which represented 
chest wall tissue was originated from breast tissue and the review 
of previous right breast tissue revealed epithelioid cell neoplasm 
arranged in cord and trabecular patterns.

Immunohistochemistry showed negativity of hormone receptors 
(ER and PR), Her-2 and high Ki-67 which consistent with report 
in the previous literature [9].

Additionally, the aggressive manifestation of tumor that caused 
rapidly growing chest wall mass, pulmonary metastases, and tu-
mor thrombi that commonly present in carcinosarcoma of breast. 
All evidences of tissue histopathology, immunohistochemistry are 
compatible with metastatic carcinosarcoma at chest wall originat-
ed from previous right breast cancer.

In terms of treatment, there is rarity of evidence for systemic treat-
ment of this cancer type, most of clinical practice use chemother-
apy which recommended for invasive breast cancer. The response 
rate of first line chemotherapy ranging from only 8-18% [9] and 
favor taxane-base regimen. However poor response to chemother-
apy, this tumor has trend to have EGFR (Epidermal Growth Factor 
Receptor) expression in almost 70% of the cases that might be 
benefit for EGFR targeting therapy.

5. Conclusion
Metastatic carcinosarcoma at chest wall with histopathology of 
the mesenchymal tumor is difficult to diagnose and poor treatment 
response with standard chemotherapy for classical invasive ductal 
carcinoma. Multi-disciplinary approach is necessary for discus-
sion using cinical contexts, histopathology, immunohistochemis-
try result.
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